

ITB #21-02-208757
Whittier Tunnel Surface Improvements
02/10/2021

Granite Construction Bristol Prime Contractors North Star Excavation Roger Hickel Contracting

Option 4A - Grout Jacking

ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	QTY:	Extended Price	Extended Price	Extended Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization/Demobilization	LS	1	\$ -			
2.1	Traffic Price Adjustment	CS	1	\$ -			
3.1	Asphlat Flageway Removal	LF	24,100	\$ -			
3.2	Expired Rubber Removal	LF	642	\$ -			
4A	Panel Leveling (Grout Jacking)	Each	532	\$ -			
5	Install Rubber Rail Seal	LF	24,742	\$ -			
6	Construction Surveying	LS	1	\$ -			
7	StarTrack Patch Repair VEP	LS	1	\$ -			
	Total Base Bid		LS	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
A1	Surface Crack Seal & Repair	LF	350				
A2	Panel Leveling (Grout Jacking)	EA	165				
	Total Additive Alternates Bid		LS	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
	Grand Total Bid - 4A			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Option 4B - Polyurethane Leveling

ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	QTY:	Extended Price	Extended Price	Extended Price	Extended Price
1	Mobilization/Demobilization	LS	1	\$ 110,000.00	\$ 110,282.07	\$ 214,185.00	\$ 418,514.00
2.1	Traffic Price Adjustment	CS	1	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
3.1	Asphlat Flageway Removal	LF	24,100	\$ 964,000.00	\$ 1,139,930.00	\$ 300,045.00	\$ 964,000.00
3.2	Expired Rubber Removal	LF	642	\$ 25,680.00	\$ 16,338.90	\$ 22,996.44	\$ 11,556.00
4B	Panel Leveling (Polyurethane)	Each	532	\$ 1,170,400.00	\$ 1,315,024.20	\$ 1,199,660.00	\$ 1,117,200.00
5	Install Rubber Rail Seal	LF	24,742	\$ 742,260.00	\$ 719,002.52	\$ 115,050.30	\$ 593,808.00
6	Construction Surveying	LS	1	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 61,169.20	\$ 50,000.00	\$ 48,200.00
7	StarTrack Patch Repair VEP	LS	1	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 10,143.70	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 2,700.00
	Total Base Bid		LS	\$ 3,047,340.00	\$ 3,371,890.59	\$ 1,909,936.74	\$ 3,155,978.00
A1	Surface Crack Seal & Repair	LF	350	\$ 17,500.00	\$ 15,018.50	\$ 29,400.00	\$ 22,400.00
A2	Panel Leveling (Polyurethane)	EA	165	\$ 264,000.00	\$ 298,181.40	\$ 279,675.00	\$ 268,950.00
	Total Additive Alternates Bid		LS	\$ 281,500.00	\$ 313,199.90	\$ 309,075.00	\$ 291,350.00
	Grand Total Bid - 4B			\$ 3,328,840.00	\$ 3,685,090.49	\$ 2,219,011.74	\$ 3,447,328.00